
Family Group Sheet for Samuel WOODMANSEE

Samuel WOODMANSEEHusband:

Birth: 27 Dec 1754 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Death: 26 Apr 1837 in Fairfield, Highland, Ohio, USA

Burial: 28 Apr 1837

Marriage: 1776 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Penelope WORDEN

Father: David WOODMANSEE

Mother:

Alice JEFFREYWife:

Birth: 08 Mar 1761 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Death: 01 Mar 1836 in New Lexington, Perry, Ohio, USA

Burial: 03 Mar 1836

Mary Longstreet

Father: Francis Jeffrey III

Mother:

Children:

Name: Phoebe WOODMANSEE

Birth: 08 Apr 1802 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Death: May 1883 in Highland, Ohio, USA

Marriage: 01 Mar 1821 in Fairfield, Highland, Ohio, USA

1

F

Charles Washington CONWAYSpouse:

Name: Job Woodmansee

Birth: 07 Sep 1777 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

2

M

Name: Mary Woodmansee

Birth: 22 May 1779 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Death: 13 Sep 1866 in Fairfield, Highland, Ohio, USA

Burial:

3

F

Name: David S Woodmansee

Birth: 12 Mar 1781 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Death: 20 Mar 1854 in Highland, Ohio, USA

Burial: 22 Mar 1854

4

M

Name: Francis Woodmansee

Birth: 10 May 1783 in Toms River, Ocean, New Jersey, USA

Death: 11 Nov 1865 in Highland, Ohio, USA

Burial: 13 Nov 1865

5

M

Name: Isaac Woodmansee

Birth: 31 May 1785 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Death: 29 Apr 1871 in Lexington, Highland, Ohio, USA

Burial:

6

M

Name: Penelope Woodmansee

Birth: 06 May 1787 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

7

F

Name: Hannah Woodmansee

Birth: 02 Apr 1789 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

8

F

Name: James Woodmansee

Birth: 17 Dec 1792 in Forked River, Ocean, New Jersey, USA

Death: 08 Mar 1849 in Lee, Iowa, USA

9

M



Served in Capt. John Stout's Company, Monmouth, NJ in the Revolution. Deeded land in 1806 to a Henry 
Seguine that was adjacent to that of John Jeffrey. 

Uncited bio from Fetters: Sam'l, b. 27 Dec 1754, d. 26 Apr 1837, son of David and Penelope of Dover Twp, 
Ocean Co, NJ, married Alice Jeffrey, b. 8 Mar 1761, d. 1 Mar 1836, of his native county of a very important 
family with a long history. Emigrated Jul 1818 to Highland Co, Fairfield, OH. Preceded by son Isaac, his 
wife and his four children who settled on Lees Creek where the McVey farm is now. At least 6 kids followed 
or came with their father to Ohio. Sam'l Sr. and Alice established their home on the ___ Road near 
Highland, later the Charles P. Woodmansee farm and now the Robert Manuel Farm. 

Biographical Hist of Scioto Valley (p. 379): Sam'l Woodmansee moved westward to Highland Co, OH in 
1819 and shortly after bought 700 acres of land a part of the original Conway Military Survey. Nearly all of 
the original purchase stilll being owned by his descendants. Samuel and Alice were marrieed in 1776, the 
year of the signing of the Dec of Ind. All the Children came to Ohio at varioous times except Penelope, 

Name: Lydia Woodmansee

Birth: 02 Jan 1793 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

10

F

Name: Samuel W Woodmansee

Birth: 15 Dec 1797 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Death: 25 Oct 1875 in Highland, Ohio, USA

Burial:

11

M

Name: Alice Woodmansee

Birth: 06 Jan 1798 in Monmouth, New Jersey, USA

Burial:

12

F

Notes

Samuel WOODMANSEE

Served in Capt. John Stout's Company, Monmouth, NJ in the Revolution. Deeded land in 1806 to a Henry 
Seguine that was adjacent to that of John Jeffrey. 

Uncited bio from Fetters: Sam'l, b. 27 Dec 1754, d. 26 Apr 1837, son of David and Penelope of Dover Twp, 
Ocean Co, NJ, married Alice Jeffrey, b. 8 Mar 1761, d. 1 Mar 1836, of his native county of a very important 
family with a long history. Emigrated Jul 1818 to Highland Co, Fairfield, OH. Preceded by son Isaac, his 
wife and his four children who settled on Lees Creek where the McVey farm is now. At least 6 kids followed 
or came with their father to Ohio. Sam'l Sr. and Alice established their home on the ___ Road near 
Highland, later the Charles P. Woodmansee farm and now the Robert Manuel Farm. 

Biographical Hist of Scioto Valley (p. 379): Sam'l Woodmansee moved westward to Highland Co, OH in 
1819 and shortly after bought 700 acres of land a part of the original Conway Military Survey. Nearly all of 
the original purchase stilll being owned by his descendants. Samuel and Alice were marrieed in 1776, the 
year of the signing of the Dec of Ind. All the Children came to Ohio at varioous times except Penelope, 
Hannah and Lydia, all of whom married in New Jersey. Phoebe married Dr. Conway, a desc of Joseph 
Conway, the original owner of the "Conway Grant." GW Woodmansee has in his possession the original 
patent to 2400 acres of land given by the government to Lt. Joseph Conway. The Patent states that the 
land was given in acknowledgement of seven years of service rendered in the Revolutionary War by Lt. 
Joseph Conway, written on parchment made from the skin of a sheep, dated at Philadelphia Aug 1790, 
signed by John Adams.

Hist of Ross and Highland Counties, Ohio (p. 403): The Woodmansee family was first represented in the 
Township in 1818. Sam'l Woodmansee and his wife Alice Jeffrey came in that eyar form Monmouth Co, NJ 
and settled where Charles P. Woodmansee now lives, and a number of children came in later years. 
Samuel woodmansee died in 1837 at the age of 83. 

Will: 
Dated Fairfield Twp, 1837. $500 to David, $500 to Isaac (deducted from loan outstanding), clothes, bed, 
desk, clock, farm animals and furniture to James plus land already deeded. 100 A to Samuel. $500 to Mary 
and Alice. Property already deeded to Phebe. Random stuff to grandkids. $10 to Francis, Penelope, Lydia. 
David, Isaac, Mary executors. Forgot Hannah, added $100 to her later. (Fetters) 



Notes (con't)

year of the signing of the Dec of Ind. All the Children came to Ohio at varioous times except Penelope, 
Hannah and Lydia, all of whom married in New Jersey. Phoebe married Dr. Conway, a desc of Joseph 
Conway, the original owner of the "Conway Grant." GW Woodmansee has in his possession the original 
patent to 2400 acres of land given by the government to Lt. Joseph Conway. The Patent states that the 
land was given in acknowledgement of seven years of service rendered in the Revolutionary War by Lt. 
Joseph Conway, written on parchment made from the skin of a sheep, dated at Philadelphia Aug 1790, 
signed by John Adams.

Hist of Ross and Highland Counties, Ohio (p. 403): The Woodmansee family was first represented in the 
Township in 1818. Sam'l Woodmansee and his wife Alice Jeffrey came in that eyar form Monmouth Co, NJ 
and settled where Charles P. Woodmansee now lives, and a number of children came in later years. 
Samuel woodmansee died in 1837 at the age of 83. 
Will 
Dated Fairfield Twp, 1837. $500 to David, $500 to Isaac (deducted from loan outstanding), clothes, bed, 
desk, clock, farm animals and furniture to James plus land already deeded. 100 A to Samuel. $500 to Mary 
and Alice. Property already deeded to Phebe. Random stuff to grandkids. $10 to Francis, Penelope, Lydia. 
David, Isaac, Mary executors. Forgot Hannah, added $100 to her later. (Fetters) 

Alice JEFFREY

Alice was likely named after her mother's mother, Alice (Osborn) Longstreet. Jamie Young: A deed dated 
20 Apr 1787 lists Elsie (Alice) Woodmancy (sister), Catherine Reed (sister), and Mary Jeffrey (mother) to 
John Jeffrey 400 Acres in Dover, Southside Toms River, joining Good Luck etc. This deed would positively 
tie Alice to Francis Jeffrey, who married Mary Longstreet. Most data on ancestors stems from this source.


